
(1) 

 
 
 

 
  

 

 

Ļ¯ೇಷ ªಾಜÍ ಪĦÎ�ೆ 
 

 

DEPARTMENT OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT 
NOTIFICATION 

NO: DPAL 48 SHASANA 2024, BENGALURU, DATED:12.08.2024 
 

The Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites 

and Remains (Amendment) Bill, 2024 ಇದಃౙ  2024ರ ಆಗౣ  ൟಂಗಳ 8ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ 

ฃಜ ඩಲರ ಒඪ౭ ಡ අฉൟൿ౪ , ನ  ൟำವัಃಛಜ ಇದඝ౬  2024ರ ಕකბಟಕ 

ಅඌඛಯಮ ಒ : 35 ಎಂ්ർಜ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ಪತ ದย  (ූಗ IV-A) ಪ ಕഔಸಃಂൿ 

ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං,-  

KARNATAKA ACT NO. 35 OF 2024 
(First published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 12th day of August, 2024) 

 
THE KARNATAKA ANCIENT AND HISTORICAL MONUMENTS AND 

ARCHAEOLOGICAL SITES AND REMAINS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2024 
 (Received the assent of the Governor on the 8th day of August, 2024) 

 

An Act to amend the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and 

Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961. 

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ancient and 

Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961, (Karnataka 

Act 7 of 1962) for the purposes hereinafter  appearing; 

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy fifth  year of 

the Republic of India as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 

Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and 

Remains (Amendment) Act, 2024. 

s̈ÁUÀ  – 4ಎ 

Part – IVA 

, 12  , 2024(  , 21 , 1946) 

BENGALURU,  MONDAY, 12,  AUGUST, 2024(SHRAVANA, 21, SHAKAVARSHA, 1946) 

. 387

No.     387 



2 

(2)It shall come into force at once. 

2. Substitution of expression.- In the Karnataka Ancient and Historical 

Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 7 of 

1962)  (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) for the word “Director”, where 

ever it occur the word “Commissioner”, shall be substituted.   

3. Amendment of section 15.- In the  Principal Act, in section 15,- 

(i)  the existing clause shall be numbered as  clause (1) ; and  

(ii) after clause (1) as so numbered the following shall be inserted, namely:- 

“ (2) A Company or Firm or Limited Liability Partnership concern  (LLP) or a 

Partnership Firm, interested Societies or Cooperative Societies, Trusts or Non- 

Governmental Organisations or interested individuals are eligible to be empanelled 

as ‘Smaraka Mitras’ to adopt Ancient Monuments and Archaeological sites and 

remains, Heritage buildings and Heritage areas across Karnataka for conservation, 

preservation, restoration and annual maintenance, development of tourist basic 

and advance amenities under their corporate social responsibility (CSR) 

programme as per the stipulated guidelines or terms and conditions set forth by 

the Government of Karnataka and issued thereon from time to time by the way of 

Notification under the scheme of Adopt  a Monument”.  

     4. Amendment of section 26.- In the Principal Act, in section  26, in sub- 

section (1), in clause (iv), for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and 

for the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be 

substituted.  

     5. Amendment of section 31.- In the Principal Act, in section  31, in sub-

section (3),- 

(i) in clause (i)  for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and for 

the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be substituted; 

and  

 (ii) in clause (ii)  for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “Rupees one 

lakh” shall be substituted. 

By Order and in the name of 
the Governor of Karnataka, 

G. Sridhar 
Secretary to Government 

Department of Parliamentary Affairs 
and Legislation 



 3 

ಸൽೕಯ ವ ವರಗำ ಮൡ౨  ๎ಸನ ರಚච ಸ฿ಲಯ 
ಅඌಚච 

ಒ : ವ ๎ಇ 48 ๎ಸನ 2024, ಂಗิฆ, ൽකಂಕ:12.08.2024 
 

The Kannada Language Comprehensive Development Act, 2022 (Karnataka 

Act No. 13 of 2023)ರ ಪ ಕರಣ 6 ರലಯย  ฃಜ ඩಲคಂದ ಅඌಂತತัದ the 
Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and 

Remains (Amendment) Act, 2024 (Karnataka Act No 35 of 2024) ನ ූಂತರವඝ౬  
ಅඌಂತ ಕನ౬ ಡ ಪಠ ๅಂൿ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ಪತ ದย  (ූಗ IV-A) ಪ ಕഔಸಃಂൿ 
ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං,-  

2024 ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ಒ : 35 
(2024 ರ ಆಗౣ  ൟಂಗಳ  12ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ  ಪತ ದ เ๕ಷ ಃಯย  ෮ದฤ ಪ ಕಟ฿ಜං) 

 

ಕකბಟಕ ඩ ೕನ ಮൡ౨  ಐൟಕ  ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ ಮൡ౨  
ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2024 

 (2024 ರ ಆಗౣ  ൟಂಗಳ  8ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ฃಜ ඩಲคಂದ ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ಪഷಯมಜං) 
 

ಕකბಟಕ ඩ ೕನ ಮൡ౨  ಐൟಕ  ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ ಮൡ౨  
ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961ඝ౬  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ಡฤ ಒಂൿ ಅඌඛಯಮ.  

 ಇย  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ಉഴ ಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ඩ ೕನ ಮൡ౨  
ಐൟಕ  ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ ಮൡ౨  ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961 
(1962ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 7)ඝ౬  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ഴโൿ ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ;   

 ಇൿ, ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ ದ ಎಪ౭ ౨ ೖದඡ ವಷბದย  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ  เඋನ 
ಡಲದൽಂದ  ಈ ෨ಂൽඦ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย:- 

1. ౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ ฏಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ ඩ ೕನ 
ಮൡ౨  ಐൟಕ  ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ ಮൡ౨  ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) 
ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2024 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (2) ಇൿ, ಈ ಁಡศ ೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 2. ಪർವัಗಳ ಪ ൟೕಜච.- ಕකბಟಕ ඩ ೕನ ಮൡ౨  ಐൟಕ  ರಕಗำ 
ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ ಮൡ౨  ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961 (1962ರ ಕකბಟಕ 
ಅඌඛಯಮ 7)ರย  (ಇದರย  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ ಉว ೕං) 
“ඛඃბಶಕ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗำ ಬฆವ ಕഷಗಳว ม  “ಆಕ౨ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ತ ಯಗูಂൽಡ ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 3. ಪ ಕರಣ 15ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 15ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದย ,- 

 (i) ಪ ౨ ತเฆವ ಘಡವඝ౬  (1)ඡ ಘಡๅಂൿ ಒ ಯඝ౬  ඛೕಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

 (ii) ಡ ಒ ಯඝ౬  ඛೕಡมದ (1)ඡ ಘಡದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  
คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(2)  ರಕವඝ౬  ದൡ౨  ಡൿಆำ ವ ೕಜචಯലಯย  ౽ಲ౽ಲಃౙ  
ಅඌಚචಯ ෩ಲಕ ಕකბಟಕ ಸ౽ბರโ ඛಗൽಪലฆವ ಗბಗำ ಅಥ฿ 



4 

งඪฆವ ಷರൡ౨ ಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඛීಧචಗಳ ಅඝರ, ಉಪඛ ಅಥ฿  ಫෳბ ಅಥ฿ 
ೕ෦ತ ຄൕಛคಃ ಸಹූಜತ౷  (LLP) ౩ , ඩฤർคಃ ಫෳბ, ಆಸ౾౨ ಳ  
ഔಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಸಹ౽ರ ಘಗำ, ಟ ౣಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಸ౽ბชತರ ౩ ಗำ ಅಥ฿ 
ಆಸ౾౨ ಳ  ವ ౾౨ ಗำ,  ಅವರ ಂ౩ ಕ ೧ಕ ຄൕಛคಃ  (CSR) ౽ಯბಕ ಮಗಳ 
ಅലಯย  ಕකბಟಕർದ ಂತเฆವ ඩ ೕನ  ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗำ ಮൡ౨  
ಅವ๕ಷಗำ, ඩฏಪคಕ ಕಟౣ ಡಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඩฏಪคಕ ൞ಣಗಳ ರౘൕಡ, ರౘൕಡ, 
೧ೕ൘ೕბർ౫ ರಃౙ , ฿ბಕ ඛವბಹൕಡ ಟ ಪ ฿ಗคಡ ෩ಲ ಮൡ౨  ಆඎඛಕ 
ಲಭ ಗಳඝ౬  ಅไൽ౫ ಪലಸฤ ಅโಗಳඝ౬  ದൡ౨  ಡൿಆำ โದ౽ౙ ಜ ’ ರಕ 
෦ತ ฆ’ ಎಂಬ ಪഔౣ ಯย  ರฤ ಅವฆ ಅಹბฃಜฆ൞౨ ฉ.”  

 4. ಪ ಕರಣ 26ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 26ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದย ನ (iv)ඡ ಘಡದย  “෩ฆ ൟಂಗำಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ 
ವಷბಗಳವฉಡ” ಟ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ಲౘ 
งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 5. ಪ ಕರಣ 31ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 31ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ (3)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದย ,- 

(i) ಘಡ (i)ರย ನ “෩ฆ ൟಂಗำಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ 
ವಷბಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಟ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(ii) ಘಡ (ii)ರย ನ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ಲౘ 
งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 
  The above translation of the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments 

and Archeological Sites and Remains (Amendment) Act, 2024 (Karnataka Act No. 

35 of 2024) shall be an authoritative text in Kannada language under section 

6 of the Kannada Language Comprehensive Development Act, 2022 

(Karnataka Act No. 13 of 2023).  

 
൭ವฑඊ ಡຄ ೕഡ  
ಕකბಟಕದ ฃಜ ඩಲฆ 

 
ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ඩಲರ ಆ೦ౢ ඝರ 

ಮൡ౨  ಅವರ ກಸคನย , 
 

(೧. ๏ ೕಧฑ) 
ಸ౽ბರದ ౽ಯბದ๏ბ 

ಸൽೕಯ ವ ವರಗำ ಮൡ౨  
๎ಸನ ರಚච ಇมಒ. 

 
                                  

      [

ಮುದÎಕರು ²ಾಗೂ ಪÎ�ಾಶಕರು:- ಸಂಕಲ£ಾĩ�ಾĸಗಳ�, ಕ£ಾ�ಟಕ ªಾಜÍಪತÎ, ಸ�ಾ�ĸ �ೇಂದÎ ಮುದÎ�ಾಲಯ, ¦ೆಂಗಳ�ರು 

R.N.I.  No. KARBIL/2001/47147  POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19 

Licensed to post without prepayment   WPP No. 297 


		2024-08-12T19:21:26+0530
	THAMMAIAH




