Ber T

WRTITON TFLIXORTHTH
T Tory BB

PR-9D Bonda, Aremes, 09, ¢nx, S0I9(3RM , 0 IFIHF, OFVL) 20. A
Part - IVA BENGALURU, MONDAY, 12, AUGUST, 2024(SHRAVANA, 21, SHAKAVARSHA, 1946) No. 387

DEPARTMENT OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
NO: DPAL 48 SHASANA 2024, BENGALURU, DATED:12.08.2024

The Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites
and Remains (Amendment) Bill, 2024 |37, 20243 esnag, 3ONE 83 DI00TEOTD
00530000 W, N BRTBIT),, A0Sy SPRLINMNON QW) 20248 TOEET
90N F0835: 35 OWITON FVEET TassBITE), (307 IV-A) BT E3R23CTOT
e33R NG, -

KARNATAKA ACT NO. 35 OF 2024

(First published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 12th day of August, 2024)

THE KARNATAKA ANCIENT AND HISTORICAL MONUMENTS AND

ARCHAEOLOGICAL SITES AND REMAINS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2024
(Received the assent of the Governor on the 8™ day of August, 2024)

An Act to amend the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and
Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961.

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ancient and
Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961, (Karnataka
Act 7 of 1962) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy fifth year of
the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and

Remains (Amendment) Act, 2024.

©



S

(2)It shall come into force at once.

2. Substitution of expression.- In the Karnataka Ancient and Historical
Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 7 of
1962) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) for the word “Director”, where
ever it occur the word “Commissioner”, shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 15.- In the Principal Act, in section 15,-

(i) the existing clause shall be numbered as clause (1) ; and

(ii) after clause (1) as so numbered the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(2) A Company or Firm or Limited Liability Partnership concern (LLP) or a
Partnership Firm, interested Societies or Cooperative Societies, Trusts or Non-
Governmental Organisations or interested individuals are eligible to be empanelled
as ‘Smaraka Mitras’ to adopt Ancient Monuments and Archaeological sites and
remains, Heritage buildings and Heritage areas across Karnataka for conservation,
preservation, restoration and annual maintenance, development of tourist basic
and advance amenities under their corporate social responsibility (CSR)
programme as per the stipulated guidelines or terms and conditions set forth by
the Government of Karnataka and issued thereon from time to time by the way of
Notification under the scheme of Adopt a Monument”.

4. Amendment of section 26.- In the Principal Act, in section 26, in sub-
section (1), in clause (iv), for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and
for the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be
substituted.

5. Amendment of section 31.- In the Principal Act, in section 31, in sub-
section (3),-

(i) in clause (i) for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and for
the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be substituted;
and

(ii) in clause (ii) for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “Rupees one

lakh” shall be substituted.

By Order and in the name of

the Governor of Karnataka,
G. Sridhar
Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary Affairs

and Legislation



a

FoIDCOD HRHTTNRY) 3 FOIS 83N T30
ODITPWSI
R0835: FOT;T0YQ 48 TS 2024, 0N ¥FR T, DN00F:12.08.2024

The Kannada Language Comprehensive Development Act, 2022 (Karnataka

Act No. 13 of 2023)3 RT3T0e 6 TRONE), To2s;00OD0T e9PTYIRPPAT the
Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and
Remains (Amendment) Act, 2024 (Karnataka Act No 35 of 2024) S 20023003033,
OPT}HYI T,B BT580T) FooeddT TozsBIZIE), (3N IV-A) &TE3RLCT O
e33R N, -
2024 O 30oF 3% DD D J0ads: 35
(2024 B e&311=S, 3oNnY 123 DIOOTTWOR TROEEIT Totss BIJTT IBER FOWTONE), BRT) T)TEITNT)

FoF T TN DI), 03TeAT T IFNY) DI, P33, 3 FNY D3,
ORICRNY (3TWHI_BR) 9DODD, 2024

(2024 T esnimE, 30OMY 8¢ DTVOTFEOLN TO5e00ODOT €938 0N, SBONEONTI)

FOREET DRSS aNI), 803T/AT AYIOINGYD aNI), DTe33, AFNY DI,
9B FHRNY PO, 196130, 3TN VTN 2,0T3) LR,

Q). YILEINOW TORBY WA NRL3NLMON Toor&dT HYWS 03I,
£0302T AROTNY e03), 033, AINY 3), HRNY HDIODD, 1961
(19620 TROEET L9RDAOND 7)), T FBE e300 T30 O3INT.200NTI) D OTS;

AR, O8I MEITHE D&@,3, 4B SREBL), TREET ToXs PO
FDOBOTRDOT T8 3V0RNTO03 9RO eI ):-

1. J0Z R, BRI DI, WYTB0.- (1) B8 LIPIODNNER, TRIEET 59)23¢S
D3, 03To2T FITING 93, Y033, RINY 03, WSHRNY (3TFD)
9RO, 2024 DO FBONIT, ..

(2) BT, S8 TRBSC 0N WIB3T,T),;

2. BORINY &) 303RCHR.- ToorEdT DY s3I, 803TAT A STNYD
D), W03IF, AFNY DI, WRBHINY PRI, 1961 (19628 TeEdT
ORI 7)3S), (VWTA), Y,3N0T 3RO 9PN OT) 3 LDAR)
"ATRETT' DOW BWNPY  WAE TRNFS e, "eSA3NT,"  Q0W  BWNRPI,
By3;0DNER0N &)303CR R 3T,

3. B30 150 SWI_RBR.- 2DR 9DICNNT 15:3¢ BFTLE),, -

(i) &yR,BedT0ES DOTBETI, (1) DOTROT) ROAB;0NTY, ABIT,L,,; eI,

(i) Dot ROB5ONT), BT (1) DOBWE 33000 B8 eODIT,
~AORIT,,, DOTWT:-

"2) AOITRI, W), 3IRFAS BRCBIODRBONE).  FToOTOOT,
IDRRTIOD NRDT TREET FTOE Tag) INDBEATIER e00NE RRBNY) 95300



R.N.I. No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297

9

CRDATIE ROINNE) &N, DVOFPING 9IVAT, TOB) I @WeE E9IG0
203 BPWMNOOT ABPINS, (LLP) ROF, @DoOIW0DT F'e, SRIONNY,
RRREIND) 90 FBTT FOFPNY, EYTENY) 9T ATE I ROR N 9T
SRAFONY, BsBNY), 930 AR0AT AORT BRBWMNEDT  (CSR) ToONE TN
9RONE), FOFEITDOT;03edTe DY AO,OTIND) eI, WTII, A INY) eI,
93HRNY), FWOTOIOT TEBNE) 2NI), DOCOROT IJoNY TFHI, AOTTHN,
CBRCE DO 0T, WOAET D36 BB BONR  eIdANDNR &DR® aNI), ST
POPNPI), WP RBRR) OPYNPI, B, INBITR,DTT,N 'm0 0T
eIJITY’ D0 TEZL0NE). AT €9333) e9TBE ToNTI33."

4. RB00 268 3T BR.- DR LRIRDDT 26:3¢ JyTTT (1)
NBRTTRTE)S (iV)S DOBTE), “e0RT) ONPINPR" D02 BBNY DTN "TTY
SRENPTBR” TN "DTTRBI AT BRTICNDR" D02 BWNY TR “20T0 OF
BRTIONNPNR" D0 BWNFI), &3 RERBRITE),.

5. ®¥FCP 310 AW BR.- RO IRIANTDT 3136 BFTTTW  (3)3C
NBRTTRE) -

() OB (HBAS "3RI JONPNPR" D0 J/INY WROR  "TR
VRENPTTNR” DOW BWRPD, NP “"DTRY AeedT CRETONPR” D0 JWNY
WROR "2,0T) OF TRTIONNPNR” D02 BHRNPI, &S RERAIT,T,,.

(i) DO (ii)BAS “"80T3 SRTY BRTICAWNLT" D0 BWNY TR 2,07 OF
BRTIONNPNR" D0 BWNFI), &3 RERBRITE),.

The above translation of the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments
and Archeological Sites and Remains (Amendment) Act, 2024 (Karnataka Act No.
35 of 2024) shall be an authoritative text in Kannada language under section
6 of the Kannada Language Comprehensive Development Act, 2022
(Karnataka Act No. 13 of 2023).

PR T WOT* 1B £E3°
FToOF 8TT U220 0D

FTOOEEIT D530 T €3230, S0
NI, 933 BIOIE),,

(2. 3e3o)
RFOETE FoONETIE
ROREOD 53553500N 5H3y,
TOAS BB Y.

BBBD Torie BBeFETx:- FoBVTIPTONR, BIFLIB ToR@3, B Beod) dwGjmevod, Wortshed

THAMMAIAH



		2024-08-12T19:21:26+0530
	THAMMAIAH




